
t 
• 

,. 

GUYANA 

ACT No. 18 of 1985 

MISCELLANEOUS ENACTMENTS (AMENDMENT) (Ne. 2) 
ACT 1985 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

SECTION 
1. Short title.
2. Amendment of certain enactments.

SCHEDULE

I 'assent. 

�Jl,(�-
H. D. HOYTE,
President.
1985-10-30



2 

No. 18) THE LAWS OF GUY ANA [A.D. 1985 

AN ACT to amentl certain enactments. 

A.D. 1985 Enacted by the Parliament of Guyana :-

Short title. 1. This Act may be cited as the Miscellaneous Enact-
ments (Amendment) (No. 2) Act 1985. 

Amenct,fem of 2. (1) The enactments specified in the first column of the
Schedule are hereby amended in the manner specified in the 
corresponding entry in the second column of that Schedule. 

certain 
enactments. 

Cap. 45: 01 

Cap. 46:02 

(2) The amendment made by this Act to section 62(2) of
the Marriage Act and to the Schedule to the Legitimacy Act 
shall be deemed to have come into operation on 9th March, 1985. 

SCHEDULE s. 2(1)

-
Registration of Births and Deaths

Enactments Amendments 

Act, Cap. 44:01 

Section 33(2) For "five dollars" wherever it oc­
curs, substitute "twenty dollars". 

Marriage Act, Cap. 45:01 

Section 22(3) 

Section 62(2) 

Legitimacy Act, Cap. 46:02 

Schedule 

For "five dollars" substitute "twenty 
dollars". 

For "forty cents" substitute "five 
dollars". 

II After paragraph 2 insert the follow­
ing paragraph as paragraph 2A -

"Fees for 2A. The fees payable 
re-registra-
tion. with respect to the re-

registration of the 
birth of a legitimated 
person shall be five 
dollars.". 

Passed by the National Assembly on 1985-10-25. 

(Bill No. 17 /1!)85) 

fl/J 

Y/1�� 
F. A. Narain, 

Clerk of the National Assembly. 


	Page 1
	Page 2

