
SEC'T'TON 

•if�'-
. 

. 

GUYANA 

ACT No. 20 OF 1992 

MEMBERS' CLUBS (AMENDMENT) ACT 1992 

I assent, 

H. D. HOYTE,
President.

199�08-22 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

1 Short title. 
') Amendment of section 4 of the Principal Act. 
3. Amendment of section 5 of the Principal Act.
4. Amendment of section 6 of the Principal Act.
5. Amendment of section 10 of the Principal Act.

Price: $30.00 - To be purchased from the Office of the Presitlent, Geio-rgietown, Guyana.

PRINTED BY GUYANA NATIONAL PR.INTERS LTD. 



No. 20] 

A. U. 111112 

,hort titlt· 
Cap, 82:28 

Amend­
men& of 
1ecUOD 4, 
of the 
l'.r1Dc1Pal 
Aet. 

Amend., 
ment of 
section 5 
of the 
Principal 
Act. 

Amend­
me:u.t of 
section 6 
of the 
PrlnclpaJ 
Act, 

Amend­
ment of 
section 10 
of the 
Pr!nc!paJ 
Act. 

z 

LAWS OF GUYANA 

.\:'\ .\CT to amend the Members' Clubs Act. 

Enacted il\· the Parliament of Guyana:-

1. This :\ct, which amends the Members' Clubs Act.
may be cited as the Members' Clubs (Amendmrnt) Act 1992.

2. Section 4 of the Principal Act is hereby amended
as follows -

(a1 in subsection OJ by the substitution for the 
words "one thousand doJlars" of the words "ten 
thousancl dollars'': 

(b) in subsection (21. lff the substitution for the words
"two hundred arid fifty dollars" of the words
"two thousand five hundred dollars".

:j. Section 5(1) and (2) is hereby amended by the sub­
stitution for the words "one thousand dollars" of the words 
"ten thousand dollars". 

-t Section 6(3) of the Principal Act is hereby amended
ilY the substitution for the words "fifty dollars" of the words
··0n(· 1 housa11cl ctollars". 

v. Section 10 of the Principal Act is hereby amended
by the substitution for the words "fifty dollars" and "one 
hundred dollars" of the words "five hundred dollars" and 
··one thousand dollars", respectively.

!'011ed In· 1hc iVmional Assemhly on the 27th July, l.f/.<12. 

<i\'.U. No. 20/1992) 

ST: 14/2 /3/3II 

F. A. Narain.

Clerk of the � ational Assembly 


	Page 1
	Page 2

